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Members Briefing: Section 106 Agreements: Audit Meeting 
 
20th March 2009 
 
Prepared by the Development Implementation Team  

 
1.      Introduction 
 
1.1 This note provides members with: 
 

• A summary of financial contributions received to date.  
• Financial contributions not received but in signed S106 agreements: 

 
 
2.     Received Financial Contributions: 
 
2.1    LBTH currently holds £36,350,836.52 financial contributions in its S106 

account. There are 11 programme themes, the breakdown of which can be 
seen in Table 1 attached. These programme themes are allocated in this way, 
through specific S106 agreements. It is important to recognise all Section 106 
Contributions received by the Council have a specific agreed purpose and are 
focused on projects at various stages of development. These are documented 
specifically within a S106 agreement.  

 
2.2    This means that some of the programmes identified are made up of projects 

currently spending, about to start spending and others still being developed 
and/or waiting for other contributions to be secured.  Funding through Section 
106 contributions is likely to be only one of many streams of funding involved in 
project delivery, especially for larger scale projects (such as Masterplans or key 
infrastructure delivery projects). 

 
3. Financial contributions not received but in signed S106 agreements: 
 
3.1    In the last five years, 456 S106 Agreements have been signed (during the 

period 19 March 2004 – 19 March 2009). This has secured a total of 
£134,194,978 in financial contributions, although most of this money has yet to 
be received by the council. 

 
3.2 It should be noted that the £134,194,978 is not a guaranteed amount of funding 

as planning permission must be implemented before these monies are paid to 
the Council. Implementation can take up to three years from the granting of the 
permission and in some cases it may not happen at all depending upon 
whether the planning permission has been implemented or not. These ‘triggers’ 
are also specific and vary from agreement to agreement. The actual receipt of 
these amounts will be staggered across a number of years in accordance with 
specific trigger points contained within any one specific agreement. For 
example, a payment could be due upon the first occupation of a residential unit 
and another payment not due until the completion of that specific development.  
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